STATE OF NEW YORK TOWN BOARD MEETING

COUNTY OF DUTCHESS October 13, 2010
TOWN OF LA GRANGE
Present: Supervisor Jon Wagner

Councilman Gary Beck
Councilman Steve O’Hare
Councilman Joseph Luna
Councilman Ed Jessup

Recording Secretary: Christine O’Reilly-Rao, Town Clerk

Others Present: Wanda Livigni, Administrator of Public Works
Ron Blass Esq., Van De Water & Van De Water
Diana Campaglione, Environmental Consultants

The regular meeting of the Town Board was held on Wednesday, October 13, 2010, at the
LaGrange Town Hall, 120 Stringham Road. Supervisor Wagner called the meeting to order at
7:30 p.m. The Town Clerk led the flag salute.

Supervisor Wagner asked for a motion to approve the minutes for the regular meeting on
September 22, 2010. Councilman Beck so moved seconded by Councilman Jessup and carried
by all.

He asked for a motion to approve minutes for a special meeting held on October 4, 2010.
Councilman Jessup so moved seconded by Councilman Luna and carried by all.

Mr. Wagner then asked for a motion to approve the minutes for a special meeting held on
October 6, 2010.

Councilman O’Hare moved to do so, seconded by Councilman Beck and carried unanimously.

Public Hearing

Supervisor Wagner asked for a motion to open the Public Hearing for the Fact Finder’s Report
and Recommendations for a Collective Bargaining Agreement with the Civil Service Employees
Association, Inc. pursuant to the Taylor Law’s requirement due to an impasse in contract
negotiations. The Union had rejected the Fact Finder’s Report.

Councilman Luna so moved seconded by Councilman Beck and carried unanimously.

There were three highway employees present: Brian Aldrich, Union President, Joe Tighe,

Union Vice President and Douglas Russell.

Supervisor Wagner stated for the record that the recommendations made by Tia Schneider
Deneberg in the Fact — Finding Report would be made part of the permanent record and inserted
into the minutes. (SEE ADDENDUM)

There was no comment from the public; however, Supervisor Wagner stated that this report was
not due to any poor reflection on the highway employees’ work. He acknowledged that they do a
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great job and he appreciated their understanding of the difficult financial times the Town is
facing. They will try and get back to negotiations to hammer something out for 2011.
Councilman Jessup moved to close the Public Hearing seconded by Councilman Luna and
carried by all.

Mr. Wagner read the resolution regarding the Fact- Finders Report into the record.

The Board voted to pass the resolution on September 22, 2010. (SEE ADDENDUM)

After the Public Hearing, the Town Board voted by oral resolution to impose employment terms
as the following: no other changes to contract with the exception of no raise for 2010.

Councilman Luna moved to impose the terms, seconded by Councilman O’Hare and carried
unanimously.

Public Hearing

Mr. Wagner asked for a motion to open the Public Hearing for the establishment of the Harvest
Ridge Subdivision Drainage District.

Mr. Blass explained that the establishment of the drainage district is customary and necessary to
assess any homes or lands in that subdivision for stormwater management costs in that district to
relieve the general tax base from that obligation. It is a new subdivision with no one living there
as yet.

Councilman Jessup so moved, seconded by Councilman O’Hare and carried by all.

There were no comments.

Councilman Luna moved to close the Public Hearing seconded by Councilman Beck and carried
unanimously.

Supervisor Wagner asked for a motion to accept the monthly reports for September 2010.
Councilman O’Hare so moved seconded by Councilman Luna and carried by all.

Building, Planning, Zoning & Public Works: Not Available
Parks and Recreation $766.65
Highway Superintendent: $1,000.00
Justice Caplicki $29,305.00
Justice Greller $19,665.00
Town Clerk $1,552.15

Supervisor’s Report

The renovation downstairs to make a police locker room is being done in house for just under
$300 and will result in having 8 State Troopers assigned here. This was done with no additional
cost to taxpayers. Mr. Wagner stated that this will benefit the Town, especially since there will
likely be expenses passed on to municipalities by the County for sheriff patrol coverage. Having
the troopers based out of the Town Hall will give the Town a much needed police presence.

As President of the Mayors and Supervisors Association, Mr. Wagner has written to New York
State elected officials and County Executive in support of Mr. Steinhaus’ stand to stop unfunded
mandates. The letter went one step farther in asking for legislation from state legislators to
outlaw all unfunded mandates and pass downs, including the County to municipalities.
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The 2011 budget is still being worked on, with further cuts being considered. The Town Board
is currently meeting with all department heads and a budget workshop will be held on 10/20.
The estimate for retirement costs has increased from $90,000 to $140,000. State revenue sharing
has decreased by 6%. The schedules of department head budget meetings is on the website and
open to the public.

There will be no more Dial-A- Ride funding from Dutchess County Office of the Aging.

Mr. Wagner is looking into alternatives.

Correspondence

Time Warner has a list of channel changes. The list will be on file in the Clerk’s office for 2
weeks.

The Town Board will establish escrow in the amount of $5,000 for the Lakes of LaGrange (Red
Wing Properties).

This will ensure that bills such as legal fees are charged to the applicant. The development is not
yet approved but is pending.

Councilman O’Hare moved to establish the escrow, seconded by Councilman Luna.

The following vote was taken:

Supervisor Wagner AYE

Councilman Luna  AYE

Councilman Beck =~ RECUSED

Councilman O’Hare AYE

Councilman Jessup AYE

The motion was carried.

The Highway Superintendent requested Board approval to award the Road Sweeping and
Highway Materials bids to the lowest bidder. (SEE ADDENDUM) This had previously been on
the agenda, but some clarification was required. Councilman Jessup and Councilman Beck were
satisfied that the bid information had been clarified.

Councilman Jessup moved to award the bids, seconded by Councilman O’Hare and carried by
all.

A request for a reduction of the Performance Bond for Frank Farm Phase 2 in the amount of
$475,575 which is 25% of the original bond amount was presented to the Board.
Councilman O’Hare moved to approve the reduction, seconded by Councilman Jessup and
carried unanimously.

The Chairman of the Conservation Advisory Council requested permission to attend the 2010
Conference on the Environment which will be held on November 19-21 in West Point. The cost
will be $575.50.

Mr. Wagner stated that Mr. Htoo works very hard for the Town and often does so at his own
expense. The amount of the conference with overnight stay is above the remaining budget
amount for the CAC. It would be necessary to make a budget amendment to finance the
conference expenses. Mr. Beck was against doing that and Mr. Jessup concurred. A motion to
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deny the request was made by Councilman Beck and seconded by Councilman Jessup. A brief
discussion followed.
Councilman Beck stated he would make a motion to approve the trip if the overnight stay was

eliminated from the expenses. Councilman Jessup seconded that motion and it carried
unanimously.

The Building Inspector requested Town Board approval to release the Site Grading Bond in the
amount of $2,500 for grid 6562-01-330958, 409 Rossway Road.

Councilman Jessup moved to approve the release seconded by Councilman O’Hare and carried
by all.

Mr. McLaughlin asked the Board to release Soil Erosion Bonds for 38, 47 and 25 Southview
Court grid # 6360-03390387, 6360-03-335429, 6360-03-351335.

Councilman Beck moved to do so seconded by Councilman O’Hare and carried by all.
Committee Reports

Water and Sewer
No report
Recreation

No report

Open Space

Councilman Jessup stated that the Pierson farm project should be done by the end of the year. He
asked the Board to approve a survey which would cost about $11,000.

Councilman Luna so moved seconded by Councilman Jessup and carried by all.

Highway
Councilman Jessup and Superintendant Kelly are still looking at salt sheds. Councilman Luna
asked if that information would be brought back to the Board. Mr. Jessup stated it would.

Town Board Comments
No comments

Town Attorney
No comment

Administrator of Public Works

Ms. Livigni stated that the item on the agenda regarding awarding a bid for demolition of the
former Titusville Wastewater Treatment Plant had already been taken care of and that the
demolition will proceed on Monday. Also the GIGP project at the Titusville Waste Water
Treatment plant was very successful and the construction was completed. She reported that
the improvement to the aeration system was tremendous. She thanked Environmental .
Consultants for their assistance. The Board thanked Ms. Livigni for her work on the project.

e ————— e ——————— et
REGULAR MEETING - OCTOBER 13, 2010 Page 4




Environmental Consultants
Ms. Campaglione stated that there had been a water main break at Noxon Road with a 30,000
gallon spill which had been repaired.

Public Comment

Councilman Luna moved to open the meeting to Public Comment. Councilman O’Hare seconded
the motion and it carried unanimously.

Paul Dougherty addressed the Board. Improvements at Red Wing Recreation area have been
made by the football groups. Parking for 120 cars is available, but an additional parking lot is
under construction. One of the volunteers oil and chipped the driveway into the parking area and
part of the parking area. One of the fields is named after his deceased son. A flag pole and a 6 by
10 flag along with a scoreboard were erected by the football group. He added that the scenery is
very good right now.

Sean Donahue addressed the Board, asking Councilman Beck why he recused himself from the
escrow vote for the Red Wing Properties. Supervisor Wagner replied that that was correct.
Councilman Beck replied he did so because that is one of his clients. Mr. Donohue asked if Mr.
Beck felt it was a potential conflict of interest and Councilman Beck replied yes. Mr. Donahue

said he just wanted to know why and that he didn’t know if there was a specific reason or not and
that he appreciated Councilman Beck’s honesty.

Councilman Luna moved to close the Public Comment, seconded by Councilman Jessup and
carried by all.

Councilman Jessup moved to adjourn, seconded by Councilman O’Hare and carried by all.
The meeting was adjourned at 7:55 p.m.

Respectfully Submitted,

@WIM o Mﬁ
Christine O’Reilly-Rao

LaGrange Town Clerk

_ﬂ%
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ADDENDUM

e Report: Fact-Finding CSEA Highway & Recreation Unit and Town of LaGrange
¢ Resolution: Setting Public Hearing Relative to the Fact- Finding Report

e Affidavits of Publication & Posting: Public Hearing

¢ Resolution: Establishment of the Harvest Ridge Drainage District

e Affidavits of Publication & Posting: Harvest Ridge

¢ Highway Bids
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NEW YORK STATE
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT RELATIONS BOARD

In the Matter of Fact Finding Between

CSEA Highway & Recreation Unit
-and-
Town of LaGrange

Re: Case No. M2009-310

FACT-FINDING REPORT
Tia Schneider Denenberg, Fact-Finder
APPEARANCES
FOR THE UNION:

Robert E. Connor, Jr., Labor Relations Specialist
Douglas Russell

Joe Tighe, Vice President

Brian Aldrich, President

FOR THE EMPLOYER:

Michael A. Richardson, Labor Relations Consultant
Jon Wagner, Town Supervisor

BACKGROUND

The parties jointly declared an impasse on January 28, 2010, in their negotiations
over a successor agreement to the current contract (January 1, 2009-December 31, 2009).
The declaration included the dates of their negotiation (November 20, December 17, and
December 22,2009, as well as January 13 and January 21, 2010). The unresolved issues were

° wage increases
] medical insurance premium contributions
] suspension of vacation accrual buy-back
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longevity (exclude new hires)
compensatory time (reduce for new hires)
vacation accumulations

payment of unused sick leave

The parties met with a PERB mediator but were unsuccessful in resolving the matter, The
undersigned was appointed on April 27, 2010, to act as fact-finder. Sessions were held on
July 1, July 6, and July 9, 2010, during which the fact-finder explored the open issues with
the parties, viewed in the context of the difficult fiscal realities facing public employment
in New York State.!

The following is the Fact-Finder’s recommendation for the settlement of this matter:
#1 - Wage Rates

51.1 Wage Schedule: The Town shall pay wages to all employees in the
negotiating unit represented by the Union, according to the wage schedule attached
to and made part of this collective bargaining agreement, which reflects an
across-the-board increase of four percent on December 31, 2011 at 11:59 p.m.

5.1.2 Rules for Wage Schedule: All new employees will be hired at the hiring rate
as shown on the Wage Schedule - Appendix A. All employees hired at the hiring
rate will advance one step on the first payday of each January until the employee
reaches the job rate, as shown on the Wage Schedule - Appendix A.

#2 - Medical Insurance Premiums

9.1.4 Premium Payment: The Town will pay 88 percent of the monthly premium
for individual medical coverage, 88 percent of the monthly premium for two-person
coverage, or 88 percent of the monthly premium for family medical insurance
coverage, as the case may be, for each regular full-time employee. The employee's
contribution to the medical insurance premium will be deducted from the
employee's paycheck.

! The last session was a lengthy conference call.
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Effective December 31, 2011, the Town will pay 85 percent of the monthly premium
for individual coverage, two-person coverage, or family coverage, as the case may
be. The employee's contribution to the premium will be deducted from the
employee's regular paycheck. The employee may designate that the deduction be
made on a pre-tax basis on a form which shall be provided by the Town.

#3 - Vacation Buy-Back

7.2.5 Annual Buy-Back: The following provision shall be suspended from January
1,2010, through December 31, 2011. An employee may elect to receive cash payment
for up to forty hours of accumulated vacation leave credits during any calendar year
(January 1 through December 31). Payment shall be made within the pay period
following the date the request was made. Payment shall be at the employee's then
current rate of pay. To be eligible for this buy-back, the employee must give notice
on or before October 15th prior to the fiscal year in which the employee intends to
receive the payment (this requirement will be waived in cases of a fiscal emergency).

#4 -Vacation Accumulation

7.2.4 Accumulation: For an employee before January 1, 2010, the employee may
accumulate vacation time without limit. Employees may save up to one-half of their
vacation each year towards retirement. An employee must use at least one-half of
their annual vacation each year, and the remaining portion up to one-half may be
saved. At retirement, an employee will be paid for all vacation that is on the books
at the employee's then current rate of pay. To be eligible for this cash out, the
employee must give notice of retirement on or before October 15th prior to the fiscal
year in which the employee intends to retire (this requirement will be waived in
cases of disability retirement or other emergency that necessitates retirement).

For an employee hired on or after January 1, 2010, the employee may accumulate
vacation time without limit. Employees may save up to one-half of their vacation
each year towards retirement. An employee must use at least one-half of their
annual vacation each year, and the remaining portion up to one-half may be saved.
At retirement, an employee will be paid for all vacation that is on the books at 50
percent of the employee's then current rate of pay. To be eligible for this cash out,
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the employee must give notice of retirement on or before October 15th prior to the
fiscal year in which the employee intends to retire (this requirement will be waived
in cases of disability retirement or other emergency that necessitates retirement).

#5 - Payment for Unused Sick-Leave

7.3.10 Retirement Buy-Back: The following provision applies only to Richard Gatto,
Arthur Daniels, and Daniel McCallister: An employee who retires from the Town
and has applied for and been granted a retirement benefit from the New York State
Employees' Retirement System may elect to receive cash payment for those unused
sick leave credits accumulated prior to January 1, 1997 at one hundred percent (100
percent) of the employee's rate of pay at the time of retirement and for those unused
sick leave credits accumulated since January 1, 1997 at fifty percent (50 percent) of
the employee's rate of pay at the time of retirement.”

#6 - Overtime Assignment

6.1.3 Procedure for Assigning Overtime Work: Overtime work shall be awarded
according to seniority by job classification (MEO then HMEO then Mechanic then
Mechanics Helper) to the extent that an employee in a given job classification is
required for overtime work. In the event no employee volunteers, the work will be
assigned on a seniority basis (least senior first) to all regular full-time employees in
the affected job title.

An employee promoted to a higher job title shall be placed last on the list of
seniority within that title for purposes of overtime assignment; and in the event that
that employee is demoted to a lower job classification, the employee shall be
returned to the employee's former position on the seniority list for overtime work
assignment. Also, an employee shall not be assigned to work out of the employee's
classification, if an employee from the needed job title is available.

2 For all other employees, unused sick leave may be applied as set forth in 7.3.9 of the current

collective bargaining agreement.
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In the event that an employee is called for overtime for snow removal and in the
event that the employee is unable to respond to such call due to sickness or absence
from the employee's home at the time said call is made, such failure to respond shall
not be a cause to refuse to assign overtime to said employee. An employee who
takes "family sick leave" in accordance with section 7.3.5, will remain eligible for
overtime.

#7 - Holdover Overtime

53.1 Holdover Minimum: If an employee is required to work beyond the
employee's regular work day, the employee will be paid for at least one hour at the
overtime rate of pay. For example, if an employee is required to work twenty
minutes beyond the employee's regular quitting time, the employee will be paid for
one hour at the employee's overtime rate; if the employee is required to work ninety
minutes beyond the employee's regular quitting time, because the employee will
have worked for more than one hour, the employee will be paid for ninety minutes
at the employee's overtime rate.

#8 - Personal Leave

7.4.1 Allowance (front-loaded): On January 1, 2010 each full-time employee will
be credited with twenty-four hours of paid personal leave. On January 1,2011, each
full-time employee will be credited with thirty-two hours of paid personal leave;
thereafter, each full-time employee will be credited with thirty-two hours of paid
personal leave on January 1st of each year.

Additional personal leave days may be given at the discretion of the Highway
Superintendent or Recreation Director, where an emergency situation warrants such
action. Should the employee disagree with the decision of the Highway
Superintendent or Recreation Director, the Town Board will review and render final
decision.
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#9 - Incremental Use of Leave Credits

7.2.7 Scheduling: Vacation may not be used in less than thirty-minute increments.
No employee shall be allowed to take more than four continuous weeks in any
calendar year.

7.3.4 Scheduling: Sick time can be used in thirty-minute increments.

#10 - Layoff Leave Accruals

11.3.6 Leave Accruals: An employee who is laid off will have the option of being
paid for whatever leave credits the employee is eligible to be paid for or choosing
to "bank" any or all of those leave credits in the event the employee is recalled. If the
employee chooses to bank credits and the employee is not recalled or otherwise
returned to work within 36 months, the employee will be paid for all leave credits
the employee is eligible to be paid for at the rate of pay at the time of the layoff.
(Note: the employee may elect to be paid at any time during this 36-month period.)
This provision does not apply to compensatory leave credits which must be paid
out.

Tia Schneider Denenberg
Fact-Finder

Dated: July 23, 2010



RESOLUTION
Setting a Public Hearing
with Respect to the Fact-Finder’s Report and Recommendations
for a Collective Bargaining Agreement with the
Civil Service Employees Association, Inc.
for the Town of LaGrange Highway and Recreation Unit

WHEREAS, the Town of LaGrange and the Civil Service Employees Association, Inc.
began negotiations on or about November 20, 2009 for a collective bargaining agreement
for the period January 1, 2010 through December 31, 2011 for the bargaining unit
consisting of employees in the highway department and recreation department, and,
thereafter, the parties negotiated on December 17 and December 22, 2009, and on
January 13 and January 21, 2010; and,

WHEREAS, the parties jointly declared an impasse in negotiations on January 28, 2010
and submitted the impasse to a mediator appointed by the Public Employment Relations
Board (PERB) which resulted in a tentative agreement on all issues; and,

WHEREAS, the members of the bargaining unit rejected the mediated tentative
agreement and, therefore, the Town submitted the impasse to PERB for fact-finding; and,

WHEREAS, fact-finding hearings were held on July 1, July 6, and July 9, 2010, during
which the Fact-Finder explored the open issues with the parties, viewed in the context of
the difficult fiscal realities facing public employment in New York State; and,

WHEREAS, the Fact-Finder’s report and recommendations, which is attached to this
resolution, were issued on July 23, 2010; and,

WHEREAS, the bargaining unit members rejected the Fact-Finder’s recommendations on
or about August 12, 2010; and

WHEREAS, in accordance with the Taylor Law, if one or both parties do not accept the
fact-finding report in its entirety, then the next step is for the Town Board to conduct a
public hearing at which the parties may explain their positions with respect to the Fact-
Finder’s report and recommendations and, thereafter, the Town Board may take such
action as it deems to be in the public interest, including the interest of the employees
involved; and,

WHEREAS, after the public hearing, the Town Board may choose to impose
employment terms for the period January 1, 2010 to December 31, 2010 provided such
imposition does not change the terms of an expired collective bargaining agreement, now,
therefore be it

RESOLVED, that the Town Board hereby designates October 13, 2010 at 7:30 o’clock as
the date and time for a public hearing at which Civil Service Employees Association, Inc.




may explain its position with respect to the Fact-Finder’s report and recommendations,
and be it further

RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk is hereby directed to forward certified copies of this
resolution to the appropriate Town officials and representatives of Civil Service
Employees Association, Inc.

The foregoing resolution was voted upon with all councilmen voting as follows:

Supervisor Wagner AYE

Councilman Luna AYE
Councilman Beck AYE
Councilman O’Hare AYE
Councilman Jessup AYE

DATED: LaGrangeville, New York
September 22, 2010

O /2.

istine O’Reilly- Rao 0
Town Clerk
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='IT OF PUBLICATION

State of New York

County of Dutchcss'

City of Poughkeepsie
Rita Lombardi, of the City of Poughkeepsie,

Dutchess County, New York, being duly sworn, says

that at the several times hereinafter mentioned he/she
was and still is the Principle Clerk of the Poughkeepsie
Newspapers Division of Gannett Satellite Information
Network, Inc., publisher of the Poughkeepsie Journal, a
newspaper published every day n the year 2010 in the
city of Poughkeepste, Dutchess County. New York. and
that the annexed Notice was duly published in the said

newspaper for ___one insertion—— -

successively, in each week, commencing on the _ 3rd.

day of Oct. in the yearof _2010 __ and

on the following dates thereafter, namely on.

And ending on the ______ day of __n

the yearof 2010 . both days inclusive
S%ubsc%d{ and swomn to before me this .5 ' day

n the - year of 2010 _

IMPSON o e
m'\@mlmnussmn exp

Notar{ Publ}

i/lf/za/’f/
A

Commission Expires Januarv 4 9014




(4) It is in the public interest to establish the proposed
drainage district as hereinafter described, and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED AND DETERMINED, that the Town Board
does hereby approve the establishment of a drainage district as
hereinafter described to be known as the Harvest Ridge
Subdivision Drainage District (hereinafter the "District"); that
the improvements described in the Map and Plan be constructed,
and that the service therein described be provided for upon the
required funds being made available or provided for; and that the
drainage district be bounded and described as set forth on the
map forming a part of the Map and Plan filed with the Town Clerk,
and which drainage district is described and bounded to include
the real property identified by the tax parcel numbers within
Exhibit "A" annexed.

The foregoing resolution was voted upon with all councilmen

voting as follows:

Supefvisor Wagner AYE

Councilman Luna AYE

Councilman Beck AYE

Councilman O’Hare AYE

Councilman Jessup AYE
DATED: LaGrangeville, New York

CHRISTINE O'REILLY-RAO 0/
TOWN CLERK




STATE OF NEW YORK )
) SS.:
COUNTY OF DUTCHESS)
I, the undersigned Clerk of the Town of LaGrange, New York,
DO HEREBY CERTIFY:

That I have compared the foregoing copy of Resolution for

Establishment of the Harvest Ridge Subdivision Drainage District

After Public Hearing, with the original thereof on file in my

office and that the same is a true and correct copy of said
original and of the whole of said original so far as the same
relates to the subject matters herein referred to.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed

the seal of said Town this 13th day of October, 2010.

seal- "REILLY-RAO, @OWN CLERK

SAWPDOCS\LaGrange (0070)\Harvest Ridge (486)\Resolutions\10.13.10 Resolution forming Drainage District.doc



AFFIDAVIT OF POSTING

STATE OF NEW YORK
SS:
COUNTY OF DUTCHESS

CHRISTINE O’REILLY-RAO, being duly sworn, says that she is the Town Clerk of the Town of
LaGrange, Dutchess County, New York;

ORDER BY THE TOWN BOARD FOR A PUBLIC HEARING FOR THE ESTABLISHMENT OF THE
HARVEST RIDGE DRAINAGE DISTRICT

Was posted conspicuously on the sign board maintained by the Town Clerk, pursuant to subdivision 6 of
Section 30 of the Town Law, located at the main entrance to the office of the town clerk of the Town of
LaGrange, Town Hall, Stringham Road, in said Town hearing was conspicuously posted and securely
fastened to said sign board.

Christine O’Reilly-Rao Q
LaGrange Town Clerk

October 3, 2010
Sworn to before me this IS AL

Day of (D ¢k. 2010

NANCY J. BAUGHM
Notary Public, State of Nérvy York
Qualified in Dutchess County

: No. 01BA6129543
M 122! qﬂ Commission Expires June 27, 20 _6
NOTARY



AFFIDAVIT OF POSTING

STATE OF NEW YORK
SS:
COUNTY OF DUTCHESS

CHRISTINE O’REILLY-RAO, being duly sworn, says that she is the Town Clerk of the Town of
LaGrange, Dutchess County, New York;

ORDER BY THE TOWN BOARD FOR ESTABLISHMENT OF THE HARVEST RIDGE DRAINAGE
DISTRICT

Was posted conspicuously on the sign board maintained by the Town Clerk, pursuant to subdivision 6 of
Section 30 of the Town Law, located at the main entrance to the office of the town clerk of the Town of
LaGrange, Town Hall, Stringham Road, in said Town hearing was conspicuously posted and securely
fastened to said sign board.

Ot Oty oo
Christine O’Reilly-Rao Q"
LaGrange Town Clerk

October 13, 2010

. = ¥
Sworn to before me this l )

Day ofOct 2010 NANCY J. BAUGHMAN
y of @ Notary Public, State of New York
Qualified in Dutchess County
_No. 01BA6129543
Commission Expires June 27, 20 VLS

Non J%W\mm

NOTARYU
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proposed- . to. -be --ex-

pended-for the drainage
improvements. - is$0.00,
since the cost of the im-
rovements “‘shall- - be
orne by the developer,
and .- said capital .im-
provements are . pro-
posed ‘to be .dedicated
to- the. -gr;opqs.eda drain-
age district;and: .

WHEREAS, " as- set. forth|
within: - 'the’.“Map“and
Plan::which. is” on  file
with the Town " Clerk,
the “‘estimated  amount
anticipated. ‘to be’ ex-
pended:annually - by the
?r_opqsed‘ drainage . dis-
rict:“for. the operation
and-maintenance of the
facilities™ is. - $16,000.00
per:year, and the ‘annu-
al -benefit assessment
cost to"the typical grop-’
erty, .which- " will be a

one-family .home, - ‘shall{ ning alorig - the “souther-| said Dorinelly,  said
initially::." . approximate [ly:and seasterly lines of| point alf‘o;,belng on the
$320.00 per year based|said-Parcel-A. the -fol- reasterly .. line"“of - [ands

that- annual” bud-{ lowin courses: and- dis-| now: /. ‘Alves;

read -over fifty|tances: i South:-71° 05| Liber:19¢ &

nefit units;and  126* East 3635 feet, .on afthence. J
ERED, ; this - Board| curve:to- the: right -hav: Inorthwesterly er;

will"hold"a public hear-{ing~a radius of -53.001and : run; e
irhq Yo consider . the|feet and an. arc. length; eastefly'l: an i
adoption-of  the- petition|of 20.12" feet; ‘North. 257/ lines “of I'said* Alv ,thg
\n

and relevant. matters on
October:-13; -.2010,  at
7:30-p.m., -at the Town
{Hall,- Town .of LaGrange,
|County: - of - -Dutchess,
New. York, . All: persons

along‘the “sou

the ' southwesteriy. -

O'REILLY-RAQ, TOWN
CLERK .~ - "
Harvest “Ridge Subdivi-
sion

being at fhe southeast
erly “corner "of said- Es-
tate of Karl-Ehmer, said
point also.. bemfg on-the
westerly: line of the Ta-

Lot No: 1 through Lot -
No.:55 '

Excluding Parcel.A conic: - State . Parkway;
-91.508*Acre Parcel thence . -leaving saud
Town of LaGrange” southeasterly - * cornet
Dutchess Coun- and: running’ along - the
ty, New York . - |westerly  line . of = said
Beginning at "'a " point; ut

sald -point-being, at. the 5
'southeasterly  cornierof|a
Lot No.:53 as.sh

a-map entitled, ) Noxon
ke Subdivision*. on “th leaving
the'.- Dutchess sa‘id‘weﬂte -of the

- Clerks Office asi Taconic | State: Parkway
Filed:Map- No.~ 10517; and ‘running ‘along the
sald- point also being:on northeﬂ% line:of " sald
the. northerly -line- of|Noxon: - 0ad, South: 69

51" 40 West 561.69 feet
to“a point being at the
southeasterly “corner “of
lands " now- or. formerly
Donnelly, - ‘Liber - 2014,
Page 412 thence [eav-

(Noxon - “Road; * thence
leaving sajd southeast-
erly: “corner and " said
northerly road line’, and
running - along the east-
erly-line of said Lots No.

409.76 feet t a point 96-057 L

Rita Lombardi,

4143

Journal

PUBLICATION

State of New York
County of Dutchcss-
City of Poughkeepsie

of the City of Poughkeepsie,

ing said . northerly. fine
of Noxon Road - and said

southeasterly: . corner
and. running’ alon'[g‘ ithe
easterlyTand, “northerly

53, 51, 52, 53, 54,-and ‘55,
North | 18* 54’ 34 East
1,377.27 feet to a point
being at .the - northeast
erly:.corner - of Lot N

'55,..said: point alsp being| ines: of " said..Donnelly
on the southerly line of|t e follow urses
Lot Na. 60;: then and - distang Nord
Ing. sa 0 50

'COFner. : 304

of said:Lot No. 60, °

71205 26“ East ' 17 ,
feet-to:a point being at West | 72.71 feet, ‘North
cor-[86 31" 30 West 28,22
‘ner. of lands now or for- | feet; North' 849" 40%
merly the Town.:of. La-{West -30.30 feet, South
Grange . (Parcel " A):182% 00" 00“ West 120,50
thence - leaving " said|feet, and. South 86 58'
southerly line of Lot No.|30% 'West 300.78 feet to
60 -and said- southwes-|a . point beinig” -at - the|.
terly. corner ‘and run- northwesterly: - corner : of

o7 56" West 32.04 feet,| following ~courses -and| day of
North 18 54' 30 East|distances: North. 15 12’

456.04  feet, " North 40° 130 West 117.04" . feet,|
18'.30% East. 38,72 feet,|'South' 50%:52' 00" ‘West
South 51 42!, 54“ East|25.56. feet, South: 63 45"
305.53 -feet, “North . 44°}10% ‘West-: 35,18 feet,

Dutchess County, New York, being duly sworn, says
that at the several times hereinafter mentioned he/she
was and still is the Principle Clerk of the Poughkeepsie
Newspapers Division of Gannett Satellite Information
Network, Inc., publisher of the Poughkeepsie Journal, a
newspaper published every day in the year 2010 in the
city of Poughkeepsie, Dutchess County. New York. and
that the annexed Notice was duly published in the said

newspaper for ___ gpne insertiom——

! ‘ on the 3
successively, in each week, commencing

Oct. in the year of _ 2010 and

on the following dates thereafter, namely on

interested “in "this - mat-| 59" 31% East 856,01 feet;[South. 7 251740 ‘West T
ter shall be. heard, and|and’ North' 89' 54 40" 142.47 feet, South 74 38'
itisfurther "~ East - 203.2 et 10" ‘al 00 West 12131 feet,
ORDERED, . that. . -the|point ,“being . - the|South .7, 1.:12°; 40% West
Town:Clerk-of the:Town northwesterly./cornér. of|41.26 feet. . and: South
of .LaGrange' Is: hereby lands ;. now . o formerly! 60° West 113535,
authorized and directed|the Es arl Ehm-| feet: it being .at'
10 ‘publish> a":: 1510, Page 327/ the . northwesterly cor-;
... leaving. > said|'ner.-of -said-- Alves; -sald!
ine of Parcel Alpoint aiso_ being-on 'thgi
. northwesterly;aforementioned-.: -north-
and-. - running | erly line of Noxo ad;? .
he  westerly. andfthence - leaving: - 'said:
nes “of . sald|northwesterly - comer|
¢ {: :Karl .Ehmer|and running along- the! I
-J&co) :same.on the|the following': - courses northerly. -ling. ‘of. said -
sign-noard" of “the Town |and distances: . South road . the : - following
of LaGrange, -in thel3®° 14’22 West 635.38courses | and: - distances: day of . n

same_time -and " manner,
tas  required- by . Town
Law 0193: ;
[ Supervisor:-WagnerAYE
Councilman LunaAYE
“1Councilman BeckAYE
pro- | Councilman O'HareAYE
-| Councilman JessupAYE:

) DATED:LaGrangevile, -
e St 2,200
e| September:2 (

eHRisTINE

"|872.46' 100 East :163.50]62¢. 54" 30%

|feet, South 11° 27 194

feet, “South 23* 11’ 09*|North 10°:28":51% - West
East 281.46: feet, South|75. - 3
01" 3816 -West :241.77 20+
feet, North 75'. 02" 40%
East' 30.27 - feet; North{136.69 feet, a

) 79
feet to-the: point: of be-
glnmng i containing
91,508"acres of land. -
Paggi;. . Martin" & “iDel
West ' 5143 feet, and|Bene, LLP: - :
South: 53* 11'703%East|September

feet; South 78" 48’ 1

7

/( D

And ending on the
the yearof 2010

, both days inclusive

»

r"‘([

ed pnd sworn to before me this 2 A
A In the year of 2010

P
¢ / Ve
v S Yy L
{A«iv\il/\ ()LW\//' 2

day

ROSE ANN SIMPSON
Notary Public, State offNew

Y18 comnussion expires

Notahy gublig
7 l//z_.o/‘/
77 ’

No. 01516215 93‘
Qualified in Dulchiest County
Commission Expires January 4, 2014




TOWN OF LAGRANGE
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

130 STRINGHAM ROAD
LAGRANGEVILLE, NY 12540
845-452-2720 845-452-2709 FAX

DATE: September 28, 2010

TO: The Town Board

FROM: Michael Kelly

RE: Award Material and Road Sweeping Contract for 2010-2011

After reviewing all bids that were submitted to the Town for the “Material and Road
Sweeping Contracts for October 1, 2010-September 30, 20117, it is my recommendation
that we award these bids to the following vendors marked in BOLD print as they were
the lowest bidders.

Thank you,

Michael Kelly,

Highway Superintendent



BID RESULTS -2010-2011

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
UNLEADED GASOLINE

ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER

PER GALLON

1. Jeff Daley & Sons Oil Service, Inc. $ .1399 over rack price at delivery
131 Pine Hill Road

Pleasant Valley, NY 12569
845-635-8522




BID RESULTS —-2010-2011
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

WASHED HIGHWAY GRADE SAND
ACCEPTED BID IS THE ONLY ONE TO MEET SPECS

. Red Wing Properties
P.O. Box 408
Stormville, NY 12582
845-221-2224

. Route 82 Sand & Gravel

17 Canoe Hill Road
Millbrook, NY 12545
845-266-3433

. Thalle, Industries

172 Route 9
Fishkill, NY 12524
845-896-5156

ITEM

Delivered to Hwy Garage

F.O.B Seller’s Storage

Delivered to Hwy Garage

F.O.B Seller’s Storage

Delivered to Hwy Garage

F.O.B Seller’s Storage

PERTON PERYD PLANT LOCATION
$ 19.00 $ 20.90 Billings, NY
$ 16.00 §$ 17.60 Billings, NY

$ NOBID $§ 24.00

$ NOBID $ 18.00

$ 21.00 § 30.00

$ 1500 § 21.00

Millbrook, NY

Millbrook, NY

Fishkill, NY

Fishkill, NY



1.

BID RESULTS - 2010-2011
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

DRYWELLS
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER

Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
3330 Route 9

Cold Spring, NY 10516
845-865-3771

630 + - Drywell H20 delivered to yard — H20

1000 + - Drywell H20 delivered to yard — H20

PRICE PER
DRYWELL

$ 794.00

$ 883.00




BID RESULTS - 2010-2011

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
GALVANIZED CMP
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED
SIZE MIN. GAUGE PRICE PER FT
1. Chemung Supply Corp. 427x29’ 16 $ 34.74
Box 527 497x33’ 16 $ 40.71
Elmira, NY 14902 577x38’ 16 $ 45.51
914-213-3579 647x43° 14 $ 64.64
717°x47 12 $ 96.96
777x52° 12 $ 106.56
817x59’ 12 $131.70
877x63’ 12 $ 142.46
PRICE PER BAND (Minimum width 12”)
SIZE MIN. GAUGE PRICE PER FT
427x29° 16 $ 69.45
497x33’ 16 $ 81.43
57°x38’ 16 $ 91.03
64x43’ 14 $129.28
717°x47 12 $193.92
77°x52° 12 $213.12
817x59° 12 $263.40
877x63’ 12 $284.92
SIZE MIN. GAUGE PRICE PER FT
2. Expanded Supply Products, Inc. 427x29° 16 $ 30.90
3330 Route 9 497x33’ 16 $ 36.00
Cold Spring, NY 10516 57°x38’ 16 $ 43.00
845-865-3771 647x43’ 14 $ 58.00
717x47° 12 $ 80.52
77°x52° 12 $ 108.98
817x59’ 12 $ 125.60
877x63’ 12 $ 135.00
PRICE PER BAND (Minimum width 12”)
SIZE MIN. GAUGE PRICE PER KT
427x29’° 16 $ 30.90
497x33’ 16 $ 36.00
577x38’ 16 $ 43.00
647x43’ 14 $ 58.00
717x47° 12 $ 159.83
77°x52° 12 $217.91
817°x59’ 12 $249.28

877°x63’ 12 $270.00




BID RESULTS - 2010-2011

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM (LP)
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER

PER GALLON

Quinlan Gas $ 2.51

15 Old Manchester Road
Poughkeepsie, NY 12603
845-452-7900




BID RESULTS - 2010-2011

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

BITUMINOUS MIX COLD / HOT
ACCEPTED BID RESULTS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

PRICE PER TON PLANT LOCATION
HOT COLD
Dutchess Quarry & Supply Co. $ 62.00% $ 70.00 Pleasant Valley, NY

49 Arborio Road

Pleasant Valley, NY 12569
845-635-8151

* Hot mix blacktop is subject to a price increase based on the
terminal price of asphalt binder PG64-22 @ $ 489.00 per ton.

Package Pavement Company $ NOBID § 72.00 Stormville, NY
P.O. Box 408

Stormville, NY 12582
845-221-2224

Thalle Industries $ 68.00* $ NOBID Fishkill, NY
172 Route 9
Fishkill, NY 12524 * Based on September 2010 NY'S asphalt index of $489.00.

845-896-5156




BID RESULTS - 2010-2011

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

BITUMINOUS ROAD MATERIALS
ACCEPTED BID RESULTS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER
1. Peckham Materials Corp.

P.O. Box 3779

Kingston, NY 12402

845-331-4148 MATERIALS PER GAL
Road Tars (all grades) $ NO BID
Latex Emulsion $ 2.68 per gal
Latex Primer & Sealer $ 3.28 per gal
Latex MP Material $ 2.70 per gal

Base Conditioner $ 3.28 per gal




L.

BID RESULTS -2010-2011

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

DIESEL MOTOR FUEL
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

PER GALLON
Jeff Daley & Sons Oil Service, Inc. $ .1399 over rack price at delivery
131 Pine Hill Road winter blend included in price per gal.
Pleasant Valley, NY 12569
845-635-8522
Wilson Oil $ .1385 over rack price at delivery
634 Route 52 if winter blend needed add .25 per gal.

Beacon, NY 12508
845-226-5203




BID RESULTS - 2010-2011

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

CRUSHED QUARRY STONE
ACCEPTED BID RESULTS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

DELIVERED F.O.B. PLA NT
(per ton) (per ton)
1. Dutchess Quarry & Supply Co.  Tailings $ NOBID $ NOBID
49 Arborio Road Light Stone Fill $ 23.75 $ 17.75
Pleasant Valley, NY 12569 Ya” $ 18.75 $ 12.75
845-635-8151 3/8” $ 20.50 $ 14.50
1”7 $ 23.25 $ 17.75
2”7 $ 2325 $ 17.75
1”& 27 $ 23.25 $ 17.75
Item 4 $ 22.75 $ 16.75
2. Richard Ryan Tailings $ 19.00 $ 17.00
5 Ryandale Road Light Stone Fill $ NOBID $ NO BID
LaGrangeville, NY 12540 /% $ NO BID $ NOBID
845-223-5761 3/8” $ NO BID $ NOBID
1% $ 20.00 $ 18.00
2 $ 20.00 $ 18.00
17 &2 $ 20.00 $ 18.00
Item 4 $ 18.00 $ 16.00
REJECTED BID
3. Thalle Industries ~ *#¥*¥* Tailings $ 15.00 $ 21.00
172 Route 9 Light Stone Fill $ 20.00 $ 26.50
Fishkill, NY 12524 Y $ 18.00 $ 24.50
845-896-5156 3/8” $ 18.00 $ 24.50
1% $ 18.00 $ 24.50
2” $ 18.00 $ 24.50
1”& 27 $ 18.00 $ 24.50
Item 4 $ 15.00 $ 21.50

##x++*THALLE INDUSTRIES BID FOR CRUSHED QUARRY STONE IS BEING REJECTEDFOR THE
FOLLOWING REASON: THALLE INDUSTRIES AT 12:25PM 9/21/2010 AFTER THE BID OPENING
STATED THAT THEY HAD IN ERROR REVERSED THEIR DELIVERY AND FOB FIGURES.




3.

Red Wing Properties
P.O. Box 408
Stormville, NY 12582

845-221-2224

Richard Ryan Exc. Inc.
5 Ryandale Drive
LaGrangeville, NY 12540
845-223-5761

Route 82 Sand & Gravel
17 Canoe Hill Road
Millbrook, NY 12545
845-266-3433

BID RESULTS - 2010-2011

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
R.O.B. GRAVEL

ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ITEM

R.O.B Gravel — Delivered
R.O.B Gravel - F.O.B
Town Operated Loader

R.O.B Gravel — Delivered
R.O.B Gravel - F.0.B
Town Operated Loader

R.O.B Gravel — Delivered
R.O.B Gravel - F.O.B
Town Operated Loader

PRICE PER TON PLANT LOCATION
$ 12.25 Milan, NY

$ 13.00 Billings, NY

$ NOBID

$ 15.00 LaGrangeville, NY

$ 10.50 LaGrangeville, NY
$ 10.00 LaGrangeville, NY
$ 23.50 Millbrook, NY

$ 16.00 Millbrook, NY

$ NOBID




RCT, Inc.

27 Commerce Street
Poughkeepsie, NY 12603
845-471-8700

BID RESULTS - 2010-2011
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

SUB-BASE COURSE MATERIAL “A” (CRUSHED CONCRETE)
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER
ITEM DELIVERED
(per ton)
Sub-Base Coarse, Type 1 $ 11.50
Sub-Base Coarse, Type 2 $ 11.50
Sub-Base Coarse, Type 4 $ 11.50

F.O.B. PLANT
(per ton)

$ 14.50
$ 14.50
$ 14.50




BID RESULTS —2010-2011
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

1. Chemung Supply Corp.
P.O. Box 527
Elmira, NY 14902
914-213-3579

2. Expanded Supply Products
3330 Route 9
Cold Spring, NY 10516
845-865-3771

GUIDE RAILS
BID OPENING 09/21/2010

GUIDERAIL SPECIFICATIONS

NEW “W” Beam Rail Galvanized

NEW 3” Post Galvanized

NEW 6” Post Galvanized

Rail Galvanized

USED 3” Post Galvanized

USED 6” Post Galvanized

Post Nuts & Bolts

End Piece for “W” Beam Rail Galvanized
Installation of Guiderail Complete
Installation of Guiderail Equipment

NEW “W” Beam Rail Galvanized
NEW 3” Post Galvanized

NEW 6” Post Galvanized

USED “W” Beam Rail Galvanized
USED 3” Post Galvanized

USED 6” Post Galvanized

Post Nuts & Bolts 5/8 & 1 1/4

Post Nuts & Bolts 5/8 & 2

End Piece for “W” Beam Rail Galvanized
Installation of Guiderail Complete
Installation of Guiderail Equipment

PER FT./EACH

$ 6.95 per ft.
$ 56.85 each
$ 56.85 each
$ 3.94 per ft.
$ 26.88 each
$ 26.88 each
$ .99 each
$ 52.20 each
$ 6.95 per ft.
$ 268.00 per ft.

$ 5.72 per ft.
$ 45.90 each
$ 40.25 each
$ 4.40 per ft.
$ 29.00 each
$ 29.00 each
$ .85each
$ .95each
$ 44.50 each
$ 10.49 per ft.
$ NO BID




1.

2.

Chemung Supply Corp.
P.O. Box 527

Elmira, NY 14902
914-213-3579

Expanded Supply
3330 Route 9

Cold Spring, NY, 10516

845-865-3771

BID RESULTS —2010-2011
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

CATCH BASINS

ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

247x24”x24” 1D Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
247x24”x6” Concrete Riser
247x24”x9” Concrete Riser
24”x24”x12” Concrete Riser

247x247x24” Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

427x60” x36” OD Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
42”x60” x6” Concrete Riser
427x60” x9” Concrete Riser
427x60” x12” Concrete Riser

427x60” x24” Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

30”x30”x30” OD Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
307x307x6”
307x307x9”
30”x30”x12” Concrete Riser

307x30”x24” Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

Concrete Riser

Concrete Riser

24”x24”x24” 1D Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
24”x24”x6” Concrete Riser

247x24"x9”
24"x24”x12” Concrete Riser

247x24”x24” Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

Concrete Riser

427x60” x36” OD Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
427x60” x6” Concrete Riser
427x60” x9” Concrete Riser
427x60” x12” Concrete Riser

427x60” x24” Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

30”x30”x30” OD Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
30”x307x6” Concrete Riser
30”x30”x9” Concrete Riser
30”x307x12" Concrete Riser

30”x307x24” Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin

Per Basin

Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin

Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin

Per Basin

Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin

Per Basin

Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin

Per Basin

Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin

Per Basin

$212.50
$ NO BID
$ NO BID
$ 87.50
$ 142.50

$ 362.50
$ NO BID
$ NO BID
$112.50
$ 202.50

$ NO BID
$ NO BID
$ NO BID
$ NO BID
$ NO BID

$205.00
$ 88.00
$ 98.00
$ 90.00
$ 150.00

$ 284.00
$ 125.00
$125.00
$ 130.00
$216.00

$ 259.00
$119.00
$119.00
$119.00
$195.00




BID RESULTS - 2010-2011

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

CAST IRON FRAMES AND GRATES
ACCEPTED BID RESULTS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

DEILVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED
CAST IRON CAST IRON CAST IRON
3433 BP & GRATE 24” X 24” 30” X 30”
1. Chemung Supply $619.01 $395.53 $ 446.27
P.O. Box 527
Elmira, NY 14902
914-213-3579
2. Expanded Supply Products, Inc. $ 398.00 $ 189.00 $235.00
3330 Route 9
Cold Spring, NY 10516
845-865-3771
3. Northside Supply $ 375.82 $137.28 $193.93

42 McKinley Lane
Poughkeepsie, NY 12601
845-454-3730




BID RESULTS - 2010-2011
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER

PER GALLON

1. Peckham Materials Corp. $ 1.00
P.O. Box 3779
Kingston, NY 12402
845-331-4148




BID RESULTS - 2010-2011

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

ROAD SWEEPING SERVICES
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER

PRICE PER MILE

1. East Coast Industrial Services, Inc. $ 341.00
P.O. Box 1069
Pine Bush, NY 12566
845-744-8148




